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QRG – How to add and remove a Lithium Alert - Inpatient 
 

Steps What you need to do  What it looks like 

Ward View 

When in the ward view 
double click on the patient 
bed to show the Actions and 
Information tablet. 
 
Press Record Assessment. 

 

Actions and 
Information 
tablet 

Select or double click the 
CWP My Pathway Inpatient 

 

Pathway 
The Inpatient Pathway will 
appear, select the Physical 
Health Inpatient button 

 

Physical 
Health 
Assessment 

Scroll across the top bar of 
the Physical Health 
Assessment until you read 
‘All medicines on admission’  
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Steps What you need to do  What it looks like 

Physical 
Health 
Assessment 

Click the ‘All medicines on 
admission’ button  

All medicines 
on admission 

Here you will see a drop-
down option to record if the 
patient is currently on 
Lithium or if their Lithium has 
stopped.  
 
There is also a link to 
complete the Lithium 
Prescribing and Monitoring 
form is necessary.  
 

 

Patient record 

When the form above has 
been completed that the 
patient is on Lithium an icon 
will appear in the patient 
demographic box. 
  

Patient record 

When the patient is no 
longer on Lithium, follow the 
steps above and select 
Lithium stopped and then 
the alert on the record will 
be removed.  

 


